
 1428        jkti=] fgekpy izns'k] 09 tqykbZ] 2020@18 vk"kk<+] 1942         
fof/k foHkkx 

 
vf/klwpuk 

 
f'keyk&2] 7 tqykbZZ] 2020  

 
 la[;k ,y0,y0vkj0&Mh0¼6½&8@2020&yst-&&fgekpy izns'k ds jkT;iky] Hkkjr ds lafo/kku ds 
vuqPNsn 213 ¼1½ ds v/khu iznRr 'kfDr;ksa dk iz;ksx djrs gq, fnukad 06&07&2020 dks vuqeksfnr 
vkS|ksfxd fookn ¼fgekpy izns'k la'kks/ku½ v/;kns'k] 2020 ¼2020 dk v/;kns'k la[;kad 4½ dks lafo/kku ds 
vuqPNsn 348 ¼3½ ds v/khu mlds vaxzsth izkf/kÑr ikB lfgr fgekpy izns'k bZ&jkti= esa izdkf'kr djrs 
gSaA 
 

vkns'k }kjk] 
;'koar flag pksxy] 
iz/kku lfpo ¼fof/k½A 

 
&&&&&&& 

 

2020 dk fgekpy izns'k v/;kns'k la[;kad 4 
 

vkS|ksfxd fookn ¼fgekpy izns'k la'kks/ku½ v/;kns'k] 2020 
 

 Hkkjr x.kjkT; ds bdgRrjosa o’kZ esa fgekpy izns'k ds jkT;iky }kjk iz[;kfirA  
 

 fgekpy izns'k jkT; dks ;Fkk ykxw vkS|ksfxd fookn vf/kfu;e] 1947 ¼1947 dk vf/kfu;e la[;kad 
14½ dk la'kks/ku djus ds fy, v/;kns'kA 
 

 D;ksafd fgekpy izns'k fo/kku lHkk l= esa ugha gS vkSj fgekpy izns'k ds jkT;iky dk lek/kku gks 
x;k gS fd ,slh ifjfLFkfr;ka fo|eku gSa ftuds dkj.k muds fy, rqjUr dkjZokbZ djuk vko';d gks x;k 
gS( 
 

 vr% fgekpy izns'k ds jkT;iky] Hkkjr ds lafo/kku ds vuqPNsn 213 ds [k.M ¼1½ }kjk iznRr 
'kfDr;ksa dk iz;ksx djrs gq,] fuEufyf[kr v/;kns'k iz[;kfir djrs gSa%& 
 

 1- laf{kIr uke-&&bl v/;kns”k dk laf{kIr uke vkS|ksfxd fookn ¼fgekpy izns'k la'kks/ku½ 
v/;kns'k] 2020 gSA 
 

 2- /kkjk 22 dk la”kks/ku-& fgekpy izns'k jkT; dks ;Fkk ykxw vkS|ksfxd fookn vf/kfu;e] 1947 
¼ftls blesa blds i”pkr~~~ **ewy vf/kfu;e** dgk x;k gS½ dh /kkjk 22 dh mi/kkjk ¼1½ vkSj  mi/kkjk ¼2½ esa 
**yksd mi;ksxh lsok** 'kCnksa ds i'pkr~ **vkSj xSj&yksd mi;ksxh lsok** 'kCn vUr%LFkkfir fd, tk,axsA 
 

 3- /kkjk 25 p dk la”kks/ku-& ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 25 ds [k.M ¼[k½ esa 'kCnksa ** iUnzg fnu** 
ds LFkku ij **lkB fnu**  'kCn j[ks tk,axsA 
 

 4- /kkjk 25 V dk la”kks/ku %& ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 25 V dh mi/kkjk ¼1½ esa “kCnksa **,d LkkS** 
ds LFkku ij **nks lkS** “kCn j[ks tk,axs A 
 

gLrk0@& 
                                                        ¼caMk: nRrk=s;½]             

        jkT;iky] fgekpy izns”kA 
gLrk0@& 
¼;”koar flag pksxy½  
Ikz/kku lfpo ¼fof/k½A 
 

f'keyk% 
rkjh[k% ------------ 2020 



 

 

1429jkti=] fgekpy izns'k] 09 tqykbZ] 2020@18 vk"kk<+] 1942         
AUTHORITATIVE ENGLISH TEXT 

 
     Himachal Pradesh Ordinance  No. 4 of 2020 

 
THE INDUSTRIAL DISPUTES (HIMACHAL PRADESH 

                        AMENDMENT) ORDINANCE, 2020 
 
 Promulgated by the Governor of Himachal Pradesh in the Seventy-first Year of the 
Republic of India.  
 AN ORDINANCE, to amend the Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 (Act No. 14 of 1947) in 
its application to the State of Himachal Pradesh. 
 
 WHEREAS, the Legislative Assembly of Himachal Pradesh is not in session and the 
Governor of the State of Himachal Pradesh is satisfied that the circumstances exists which render it 
necessary for him to take immediate action; 
 
 NOW, THEREFORE, in exercise of the powers conferred by clause (1) of article 213 of 
the Constitution of India, the Governor of Himachal Pradesh is pleased to promulgate the following 
Ordinance:— 
  
 1. Short title.—This Ordinance may be called the Industrial Disputes (Himachal Pradesh 
Amendment) Ordinance, 2020. 
 

 2. Amendment of Section 22.—In Section 22 of the Industrial Disputes Act, 1947, in its 
application to the State of Himachal Pradesh (hereinafter referred to as the “principal Act”), in sub-
sections (1) and (2), after the words "public utility service", the words "and non-public utility 
service" shall be inserted. 
 

 3. Amendment of Section 25F.—In Section 25 F of the principal Act, in clause (b), for 
the words "fifteen days", the words “sixty days” shall be substituted. 
 

 4. Amendment of section 25K.—In Section 25 K of the principal Act, in sub-section (1), 
for the words "one hundred", the words "two hundred" shall be substituted. 
 

Sd/- 
(BANDARU DATTATREYA), 

Governor,  
Himachal Pradesh 

 

Sd/- 
(YASHWANT SINGH CHOGAL), 
              Principal Secretary (Law). 
 

Shimla: 
Dated ……….. 2020 

_________ 

 
 eSa vkS|ksfxd fookn ¼fgekpy izns'k la'kks/ku½ v/;kns'k] 2020 ds mi;qZDr vaxzsth vuqokn dks Hkkjr 
ds lafo/kku ds vuqPNsn 348 ¼3½ ds v/khu  jkti= ¼bZ&xtV½] fgekpy izns'k esa izdkf'kr fd, tkus ds 
fy, izkf/kd`r djrk gwaA 

 
                                                          caMk: nRrk=s;]             

                       jkT;iky] fgekpy izns'kA 


